
 

   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

  

  

HEIDI  

 

 

 

3 BEDROOMS/ 3 BATHROOMS 

WOODEN ALPINE STYLE 

CENTRAL LOCATION 

SOUTH FACING BALCONY  

WOOD-BURNINNG FIREPLACE IN THE 

LIVING ROOM 

WOOD AND LOCAL GRANIT WALLS 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 
3 double bedrooms/3 bathrooms 

 
Bedroom 1, double bed, en suite bathroom 

Bedroom 2, double beds, en suite bathroom 

Bedroom 3, twin beds, bathroom next door 
 
 

Washing machine and tumble dryer 

 

 

Chalet apartment Heidi is a first floor apartment located in 
Haus Bittel in the very heart of Zermatt. Comprising the entire 
first floor (128 sqm) of a traditional, creaky, wooden, Swiss 
chalet, this is a delightful luxury ski chalet apartment which 
has been totally refurbished: a real Zermatt gem sleeping up 
to 6 people. 

Apartment Heidi is located in the heart of Zermatt, between 
the church and the school, close to the main shopping street. 
It is 1 min walk to the church square and 7 mins walk to 
Matterhorn Express lift. South facing, it overlooks a rushing 
mountain torrent and a jumble of village roofs with the 
mountains above. There are sunbathed wooden balconies on 
all sides. It is the perfect hideaway, with the best of all worlds: 
both old and new. 

A great deal of attention has gone into enhancing its old 
alpine atmosphere while providing every modern 
convenience and a sense of cozy luxury. You will be cosseted 
by weathered wood panelling and local granite walls and 
floors, an antique stone fire-stove, wooden ceiling beams, a 
unique dining table consisting of a traditional harrow under a 
glass top, a generously sized and fully specified connecting 
kitchen, and much more. 

The bedrooms are smaller; however their interior design is 
charming, giving one the feeling of snuggling down in a cozy 
mountain cabin. 

Apartment Heidi sleeps 6 although it is also ideal for smaller 
groups. It includes a number of modern comforts such as a 
large LCD flat screen TV with DVD and cable, free wireless 
broadband internet access and all usual modern kitchen 
appliances.  
A modern and traditonal wooden Swiss chalet in the centre of 
Zermatt, ideal for the perfect alpine winter or summer 
holiday! 

 



Concierge Services: Arrival in Zermatt, Resort Care, Transfers, Equipment rental, Ski school and guides, 
Restaurants, Child care, Health & Beauty and more.. 

 

Offered on a Self-Catered basis with Concierge Services 

Exclusive use of the chalet and its facilities 

Bed linen, towels, guest amenities on arrival 

Welcome and assistance from the staff pre-arrival 

In resort assistance from the concierge team 

Transfer to and from chalet from Zermatt train station on 

arrival and departure day* 

Welcome basket* 

Cleaning on departure 

Daily cleaning and linen/towel change on request 

Free access to high-speed wireless internet 

*when booking more than 5 days 

 

 

Services 
 


